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Geldof live in concert at Irish Village 
Humanitarian rocker to review local CSR initiatives before kicking off St Patrick’s 

Day weekend celebrations in Dubai 

Sir Bob Geldof will be appearing live in concert at the Irish Village on Thursday 
evening 15th March, to launch St. Patrick‟s Day weekend celebrations in Dubai. 
The legendary Irish rocker will be performing some of his classic hits such as „I 
don‟t like Mondays‟ and „Rat trap‟ as well as some of his latest material. 

Speaking at a press conference today (Wednesday 14 March) in Dubai, Sir Bob 
thanked Transguard Group – for bringing him to the UAE for the seventh year 
running and spoke of his new album, How To Compose Popular Songs That Will 
Sell.  

Last year Sir Bob Geldof performed to over 2,000 fans at the Irish Village, the 
highlight of the venue's annual three-day festival celebrating St Patrick, the 
patron saint of Ireland.  

However as one of the world‟s best-known and indeed best-loved humanitarians, 
Sir Bob also took some time out from rehearsing to recognise a number of CSR 
(corporate social responsibility) initiatives, being launched by Dubai-based 
Transguard Group and loyalty programme operator Air Miles. 
 
The Transguard Group, the company responsible for organising the concert, is 
actively engaged in three areas of CSR, namely employee welfare, sustainability 
and international charity. Sir Bob planned to visit one of its state-of-the-art 
employee accommodation centres and hand out certificates to a select group of 
employees who out of a total workforce of 18,000 staff have excelled in areas 
such as energy-saving and learning achieving advanced levels of English 
literacy.  
 
Education is a key area of Transguard‟s CSR policy, the company funds libraries 
for its staff and even arranges English language examinations to enhance career 
potential.  



 
In terms of sustainability, Transguard has a firm commitment to reduce its carbon 
emissions by over 10% equivalent to taking 286 cars off the road for a whole 
year.  
 
“In addition, the company has installed 3,750 water-saving devices throughout its 
offices and accommodation centres and is saving enough water to fill an 
Olympic-sized swimming pool every week. All-in-all, Transguard is saving $3 
million annually on its utility bills,” said Mark Povey, Communications Director at 
Transguard Group.   
 
In terms of its international charity Transguard supports Christel House India – a 
school for underprivileged children in Bangalore which it supports financially and 
thru a management trainee programme for graduating students. 
  
Keeping very much in tune with charitable sentiment, Air Miles Middle East 
launched its month-long „Lend a Mile‟ campaign. The scheme involves motivating 
any or all of the loyalty programme‟s 1.2 million Middle East members to donate 
their personal Air Miles to any Air Miles recognised charity.  
 
Those that do so will have their donations doubled courtesy of Air Miles until 15 
April 2012. In addition anyone donating during this period will have the chance of 
winning 100,000 Air Miles, in a special draw. 
 
Paul Lacey, Air Miles Middle East‟s Commercial Director, said: “As an 
organisation, we have been consistently strengthening our offering across the 
UAE, Qatar and Bahrain and we‟re now stepping up our CSR programme, with 
the month-long „Lend a Mile‟ campaign the first of a number of CSR 
announcements we have in the pipeline. 
 
“We‟re honoured to have a public figure of the stature of Sir Bob Geldof here 
today as we launch this charity drive which we are sure will translate into 
donations, in the form of Air Miles, flooding in through our website and call 
centre.” 
 

-Ends- 
 


